

September 19, 2011

# MEMORANDUM

TO:

District Board of Trustees

FROM:

Jim Murdaugh, President

SUBJECT:

Attorney Invoice - Andrews, Crabtree, Knox & Andrews, LLP

# Item Description:

Request for approval to pay the Board's attorney.

# Overview:

On a monthly basis, the Board's attorney submits an invoice for services provided.

### Salient Facts:

The College's attorney is hired by the Board under the authority of Section 1001.64(25), Florida Statutes, and for this reason invoices are brought for approval.

#### **Past Actions:**

The Board of Trustees approved the contract at the October 18, 2010 Board meeting and shall be effective through October 31, 2011. The contract may be renewed on an annual basis with four (4) consecutive one (1) year renewals for a total contract period of five (5) years. The Board shall be billed on an annual flat fee of \$160,000 for services of the firm.

#### **Future Actions:**

Monthly Invoices will be presented as they are submitted by the attorney.

# Funding/Financial Matters:

Funding is budgeted in Fund 1, the Current Unrestricted Fund. The current amount due is \$13,333.33.

#### Staff Resource:

Teresa Smith

## Recommended Action:

Authorize payment of invoices as presented.

# ANDREWS, CRABTREE, KNOX & ANDREWS, LLP

P.O. BOX 12800 TALLAHASSEE, FL 32317 TAX ID #59-3621660

August 31, 2011

Jerry Schilling Assistant Vice President for Administrative Services Tallahassee Community College 444 Appleyard Drive Tallahassee, FL 32304

Invoice# **WRM** 10085 Our file# T00007 02276 Billing through 08/30/2011

Tallahassee Community College (General)

P.O. Number: 2011 00001580

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED									
07/29/2011	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Iovanna re: FPSI expense (.1); E-mail to E. Eunice re: M. Iovanna FPSI expense (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Holliman re: Datamaxx agreement (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: Datamaxx agreement (.1); Telephone conference with E. Eunice re: Datamaxx, M. Iovanna (.1); E-mail to E. Eunice re: Datamaxx agreement (.1); E-mail to B. Holliman re: Datamaxx agreement (.1); Review of Datamaxx agreement statement of work (.3); E-mail to R. Frazier re: request for student directory information (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Ashburn re: bid protest documents (.1);	1.20 hrs.						
07/30/2011	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from A. Maxwell re: public records request bid protest (.1); E-mail to A. Maxwell re: documents produced per public records request (.1); E-mail to S. Hall re: maintenance of documents produced per public record request (.1);	0.30 hrs.						
08/01/2011	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Hall re: public record request/bid protest (.1); Telephone conference with D. Ashburn re: bid	1.20 hrs.						

protest meeting (.2); Telephone conference

with R. Tolson re: TCC employees' on DOE grant complaints (.3); Telephone conference with R. Frazier re: TCC/APD training (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: definition of "employee status" (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: formal complaint by TCC grant employees (.1); Dictation and preparation of monthly Litigation Report (.3);

08/02/2011 WRM

Receipt and review of e-mails (8) from R. Tolson re: TCC grant employees complaints (.8); Telephone conferences (2) with R. Tolson re: TCC grant employees complaints (.4); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from M. Tappen re: TCC grant employees complaints (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Dilger re: TCC grant employees complaints (.1);

1.50 hrs.

08/03/2011

WRM

Review documents, complaints, e-mails re: TCC grant employees complaints (.8); Telephone conferences (3) with R. Tolson re: TCC grant employees complaints (.3); Telephone conference with R. Frazier re: TCC/APD training (.1); Telephone conferences (3) with Avalanche/TCC Pro-Steel case (.2); Conferences with A. Brown, G. Head, D. Ramsey re: grant employee complaints (4.0); Telephone conference with J. Dodson re: Blackeney v. TCC/Flagler (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Gould re: TCC/Flagler (.1); E-mail to J. Schilling re: Blackeney v. TCC/Flagler (.1); Conference with T. Smith, J. Schilling re: bid protest (.2); Conference with T. Smith, D. Ashburn re: informal bid protest meeting (1.4); Conference with R. Tolson re: grant employee complaints (.6); Conference with V. Lawrence re: grant employee complaints (.6);

8.50 hrs.

08/04/2011

WRM Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Frazier re: Youthbuild contract (.1); Telephone conferences (4) with R. Frazier re: TCC/APD

7.50 hrs.

training (.4); Telephone conferences (2) with R. Tolson re: grant employees complaints (.2); Preparation for Brogan noise meeting (.3); Attend Brogan noise meeting with T. Smith, others (.9); Conference with T. Smith re: grant employee complaints, bid protest (.7); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Chaires-Lacy re: grant employees contracts (.1); Telephone conference with J. Chaires-Lacey re: grant employees contracts (.2); Telephone conference with G. Wells re: bid protest (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: bid protest (.1); Conference with S. Dilger re: grant employees complaint (3.1); Telephone conferences (2) with J. Smith re: terminated employee retirement, grant employees complaint, bid protest (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: terminated employee retirement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from T. Smith re: bid protest (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Chaires-Lacey re: grant employees complaints (.1); E-mail to J. Chaires-Lacey re: grant employees complaints (.1); Telephone conference with L. Killinger re: bid protest (.2); Telephone conferences (2) with T. Smith re: bid protest (.2);

08/08/2011 BJL Review and analysis of statutes and case law re: requests for proposals;

08/08/2011 BJL Prepare memo re: requests for proposals;

08/08/2011

WRM

Gadsden Re-Entry Center (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Chaires-Lacey re: grant employees complaints (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails from D. Wildes re: Gadsden

(.2); E-mail to T. Smith re: bid protest (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Frasier re: TCC/APD training (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: grant employees

Re-Entry Center (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from E. Steinmeyer re: bid protest

Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re:

3.00 hrs.

0.80 hrs.

1.10 hrs.

complaints (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from E. Steinmeyer re: bid protest (.1); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: grant employees complaint, bid protest, DOC Re-entry Center (.2);

08/09/2011 WRM

Review summary of case law re: bid protest (.2); Begin analysis re: bid protest (1.0); Telephone conferences (3) from F. Brown re: retirement hearing testimony (.5); Telephone conference with J. Christian re: retirement hearing testimony (.3); Telephone conferences (2) with T. Smith re: retirement hearing testimony (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from S. Heath re: Avalanche litigation (.2); E-mails (3) to S. Heath re: Avalanche litigation (.3); E-mails (3) to T. Smith re: Avalanche litigation (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Lesko re: DPS contracts (.1): Telephone conference with T. Smith re: Avalanche litigation (.1); Review and analysis of Workforces Plus/TCC YouthBuild contract (.9); E-mail to R. Frazier re: Youthbuild contract (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Heath re: Avalanche litigation (.1); Telephone conferences (2) with R. Tolson re: grant employees complaints (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Avalanche litigation (.1); Receipt and review of (2) DPS licences (.4); E-mail to B. Lesko re: DPS licenses (.1); Review Avalanche litigation release of Hartly Metal Buildings (.2): E-mail to S. Heath re: Heartly Metal Buildings release (.1); Preparation for continued investigation of grant employees complaints (1.5);

08/10/2011

WRM

Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Frazier re: Workforce Plus contract (.1); Conference with M. Tappan/S. Ferst re: grant employees complaints (2.0); E-mail to T. Smith/R. Tolson re: grant employees complaints (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Hollimon re: Datamaxx license (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: Datamaxx license (.1); Receipt and review of

7.10 hrs.

8.20 hrs.

TCC Foundation annual audit letter (.1): Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: grant employees complaints (.2); E-mails (2) to R. Johnston re: TCC Foundation audit (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Johnston re: TCC Foundation audit (.1); Continued analysis - bid protest RFP 2011-2012 (2.0); Telephone conference with A. Gaugh re: grant employees complaints (.1); Conference with A. Gaugh re: grant employees complaints (.6); Conference with T. Smith/R. Tolson re: grant employees complaints, other employee issues (1.2); Conference with T. Smith re: Bid Protest (.8); Conference with R. Tolson re: grant employees complaints (.4); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: grant employees complaints (.1);

08/11/2011 BJ

BJL Review and analysis of case law re: administrative requirements with requests for production;

1.50 hrs.

08/11/2011 WRM

Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Wildes re: Brogan noise complaint (.1); Brief review of employees documents re: grant employees complaints (.5); Receipt and review of e-mail from G. Wells re: personnel issues (.1); E-mail to G. Wells re: personnel issues (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: personnel issues (.1); Dictation and preparation of report re: grant employees complaint (.8); Receipt and review of USDOE/OCR determination of B.T. Complaint (.5); E-mail to S. Jefferson, others re: OCR determination in B.T. Complaint (.2); Analysis - bid protest, options, agency discretion (.4); Dictation and preparation of TCC Foundation Audit response letter (.4); Telephone conference with D. Ashburn re: bid protest (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Murdaugh re: OCR B.T. determination (.1); E-mail to L. Kling re: August Board Meeting Agenda (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from L. Kling re: August Board Meeting (.1); Receipt and review of

5.10 hrs.

Jerry Schilling

e-mail from S. Heath re: Avalanche Litigation (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: Avalanche Litigation (.1): Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Jefferson re: OCR B.T. determination (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Avalanche litigation (.1); Review August 15, 2011 Board Meeting Agenda (.5); Telephone conference with E. Steinmeyer re: bid protest (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: employee furniture compliant (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee furniture complaint/grant employees complaints (.2); Telephone conference with S. Ferst re: grant employees complaints (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: accommodation request (.1);

08/12/2011 WRM

Receipt and review of e-mail from E. Eunice re: OCR determination of B.T. complaint (.1); E-mails (2) to T. Smith re: Avalanche litigation (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from G. Wells re: meeting - Datamaxx (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: TCC policies (.1); E-mail to B. Holliman re: Datamaxx (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Holliman re: Datamaxx (.1); Telephone conference with S. Ferst re: grant employees complaints (.1); Conference with T. Smith, J. Schilling, R. Tolson, others re: bid protest, employee issues (1.5); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Heath re: Avalanche litigation (.1);

2.40 hrs.

08/15/2011

BJL Review and analysis of case law re: employee functions;

0.60 hrs.

08/15/2011

WRM Re

Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: Avalanche litigation (.2); E-mails (2) to T. Smith re: Avalanche litigation (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Datamaxx agreement (.1); E-mail to E. Steinmeyer re: protest (.1); E-mail to D. Ashburn re: protest (.1); Telephone conference

5.50 hrs.

with E. Steinmeyer re: bid protest (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Ashburn re: bid protest (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: bid protest (.1); Analysis: TCC's computer use policy (.2); Analysis: A.D.A. issue-ability to perform essential functions of job (.5); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: bid protest response (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: A.D.A. issue (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: A.D.A. issue (.1); Attend TCC Board Workshop and Business meeting (2.5); Conference with T. Smith, R. Tolson, re: various topics, including grant employees complaints, A.D.A. issue (1.0);

08/16/2011 BJL Review and analysis of policy language;

08/16/2011 WRM Dictation and preparation of correspondence to

Admin. Law Judge F. Boyd re: TCC employees participation in administrative hearing (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Banocy-Payne re: Visa - TCC state charter (.1); E-mail to M. Banocy-Payne re: Visa TCC state charter (.1); E-mails (2) to D. Ware re: Visa application - state charter (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Ware re: Visa application - state charter (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from W. Rabon re: background information - administrative hearing (.1); Review background documents from W. Rabon re: administrative hearing (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Jones re: grant employee complaints (.1); E-mail to B. Jones re: grant employee, complaints (.1); Analysis: TCC computer use policy (.2); Telephone conferences (3) with R. Tolson re: administrative hearing background (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails from G. Head/A. Brown re: grant employees complaint (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from E. Owens re: Network Family Security Case (.1): Receipt and review of e-mail from L. Spivey re: Visa application (.1); E-mail to L. Spivey

re: Visa application (.1); Telephone conference

2.00 hrs.

7.70 hrs.

with S. Fisher re: Network Family Security case (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: documents, admin. hearing (.1); Review documents (2) re: background information, admin. hearing (.1); Telephone conferences (2) with G. Christian re: administrative hearing (.2); E-mail to J. Schilling re: return of bid protest check (.1); E-mails (3) to F. Brown re: attendance at administrative hearing (.3); Telephone conferences (3) with W. Rabon re: information for administrative hearing (.4); E-mail to T. Smith re: employee attendance at administrative hearing (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Schilling re: return of bid protest check (.1); E-mail to D. Ashburn re: return of bid protest check (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from G. Christian re: administrative hearing, documents (.3); E-mails (4) to G. Christian re: administrative hearing, documents (.4); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: employee attendance at administrative hearing (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Ashburn re: return of bid protest check (.1); Telephone conferences (2) with C. Singletary re: employee attendance at administrative hearing (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Hinson re: bid protest decision (.1); E-mail to B. Hinson re: bid protest decision (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (6) from R. Tolson re: grant employees complaints (.6); Receipt and review of e-mail from A. Brown re: grant employees complaints (.1); Telephone conferences (4) with R. Tolson re: grant employees complaints, A.D.A. questions (.5); E-mail to S. Heath re: Avalanche litigation (.1); E-mails (2) to R. Tolson re: grant employees complaints (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from F. Brown re: attendance at administration hearing (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Spiers re: financial aid (.1); E-mail to B. Spiers re: financial aid (.1); Review subpoena duces

tecum to F. Brown re: administrative hearing (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: administrative hearing, grievance of action (.1); Telephone conference with K. Reeves re: attendance at administrative hearing (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: meeting prior to admin. hearing (.1); Analysis - revisions to computer use policy (.3);

08/17/2011

BJL

Review and analysis of case law re: job requirements;

0.60 hrs.

08/17/2011

WRM

Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Gould re: Blackeney v. TCC (.1); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to S. Fisher re: Network Family Security Litigation (.3): Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: administration hearing (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: administration hearing (.1); Telephone conference with J. Schilling re: Avalanche Litigation (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: Avalanche Litigation (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Pagels re: H.E. v. TCC litigation (.1); E-mail to R. Johnston re: Network Security litigation (.1); Review plaintiff's response to disposition motion in M.E. v. TCC (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Johnston re: Network Security Litigation (.1); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: Avalanche litigation (.1); E-mails (2) to M. Banocy-Payne re: Visa request, accreditation documentation (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Banocy-Payne re: Visa, accreditation documentation (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Fisher re: Network Family Security litigation (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: grant employees complaints (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: grant employees complaints (.1); Analysis - legal re: employee A.D.A. issues (.6); Analysis - legal - computer use policies (.3);

2.90 hrs.

08/18/2011

WRM Telephone conferences (2) with R. Tolson re:

4.00 hrs.

grant employees complaints (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: grant employees complaints (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Jones re: grant employees complaints (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Avalanche litigation (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: CCLA mutual non-disclosure (.1); Review and analysis of CCLA mutual non-disclosure agreement (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Ashburn re: withdrawal of bid protest (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Hinson re: protest check review (.1): Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Dartland re: Avalanche litigation (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: CCLA mutual non-disclosure agreement (.1); Analysis: the law with regard to government employees computer use (1.8); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Jones re: grant employees complaints (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from R. Tolson re: grant employees complaints (.3); Telephone conferences (2) with R. Tolson re: grant employee complaints (.2); Telephone conference with R. Tolson, J. Chapin, H. Abrams re: employee issues/duties (.3);

08/22/2011 WRM

Preparation for today's meeting re: grant employees complaints, review documents provided by employees (.9); Analysis computer use policy, other instruction's policy (2.1); Conference with B. Jones, R. Tolson, others re: grant employees complaints (1.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from E. Eunice re: former student (.1); E-mail to E. Eunice re: former student (.1); Telephone conference with E. Eunice re: former student (.2); Telephone conferences (2) with S. Rowland re: fee waiver and exemption (.3); Telephone conference with E. Steinmeyer re: windstorm mitigation RFB (.2); E-mail to T. Smith re: windstorm mitigation RFP (.1); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: Windstorm mitigation RFP,

7.60 hrs.

Brogan noise issue, employee A.D.A. (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from T. Smith re: employee A.D.A. issue (.3); E-mail to T. Smith re: employee A.D.A. issue (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Rowland re: fee exception/waiver (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from G. Wells re: personnel issues (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Singletary re: personnel issues (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: computer use policy (.1); Analysis student fee exemption/waiver question (.8); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from D. Wilder re: Brogan noise complaint (.2); Review Trane Field Report and Service

Report re: Brogan noise complaint (.2):

08/23/2011 WRM

Receipt and review of e-mail from K. Cashin re: windstorm mitigation RFP (.1); Review and analysis of whistleblower case, similar to H.E. v. TCC (.3); E-mail to R. Bush re: H.E. v. TCC (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: personnel issues (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Brogan noise issue (.1); Telephone conference with J. Schilling re: fee waivers (.2); Analysis: statutory fee exception and waivers (2.5); Telephone conference with S. Rowland re: fee exemption and waivers (.2); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to S. Rowland re: fee exemption and waivers (.5); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: Avalanche litigation (.2); E-mail to S. Heath re: Avalanche litigation (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: computer use policy (.1); E-mails (3) to T. Smith re: services contract (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from T. Smith re: services contract (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Gould re: Blackeney v. TCC/Flagler (.1); Review deposition reports in Blackeney v. TCC/Flagler (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from K. Russom re: Blackeney v. TCC/Flagler (.1); Review and analysis of case law, college

8.60 hrs.

computer use policies for consideration of new policy (2.4); Memo to T. Smith re: proposed language for computer use policy (.5); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: grant employees complaints (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: grant employees complaint (.1);

08/24/2011 BJL Review and analysis of student policies for revision of computer use policy;

1.00 hrs.

08/24/2011 WRM Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson

re: grant employees complaints (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Heath re: Avalanche litigation (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from G. Christian re: former employee retirement hearing (.1); Review deposition in M.B. criminal matter re: former employee's retirement hearing (.7); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: FLSA/TCC policies (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: FLSA/policies, A.D.A. (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Wakulla lease and Gadsden Solar project (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: Wakulla lease/Gadsden Solar project (.1); Conference with D. Wildes, T. Smith re: Brogan noise (.4); Conference with T. Smith re: leases, Gadsden Solar project (.4); Review, revise memo to T. Smith re: computer use policy (.2); E-mail to K. Gardner re: Brogan noise (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Pagels re: H.E. v.

3.20 hrs.

08/25/2011 WRM

Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee/ADA, H.E. v. TCC (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Dodson re: resolution of Blackeney v. Flagler/TCC case (.1); Analysis: employee performance, ADA issues (4.2); Analysis: University and College codes of conduct (.5); Review employee file re:

TCC (.1); Review supplemental authority in H.E. v. TCC (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from D. Ware re: VISA request support document (.2); E-mail to D. Ware re:

VISA request support document (.1);

7.40 hrs.

employee performance, ADA questions (.6); Conference with T. Smith, R. Tolson, others re: computer policy, employee issues (1.7); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Turner re: depositions in H.E. v. TCC (.1); E-mail to M. Turner re: depositions in H.E. v. TCC (.1);

08/26/2011 WRM

E-mails (5) to R. Tolson/J. Schilling re: H.E. v. TCC depositions (.5); Telephone conferences (4) with R. Bush re: H.E. v. TCC depositions, summary judgment motion (.8); Telephone conference with J. Schilling re: H.E. v. TCC witnesses (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Turner re: H.E. v. TCC witnesses (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from K. Gardner re: Brogan noise issue (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (4) from T. Smith re: Brogan noise issue (.4); E-mails (2) to T. Smith/K. Gardner re: Brogan noise issue (.2); E-mail to R. Bush re: employee interviews in H.E. v. TCC (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: H.E. v. TCC witness interviews (.1); E-mails (2) to TCC communications re: Ghazvini Grand Event (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: H.E. v. TCC interviews and depositions (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: H.E. v. TCC interviews and depositions (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: TCC employee witnesses - H.E. v. TCC (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: Brogan noise issue meeting (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Bush re: H.E. v. TCC, witness interviews (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Gould re: details of A. Blackeney v. TCC/Flagler settlement (.1); E-mail to R. Bush re: status of M.U. v. TCC matter (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from R. Tolson re: grant employees complaints (.3); Telephone conferences (2) with R. Tolson re: grant employees complaints (.2); Dictation and preparation of memo to J. Murdaugh re: monthly litigation update (.4); Review

4.90 hrs.

attachments to grant employees complaints (.2); Telephone conference with W. Spencer re: position appointment (.2);

08/29/2011 WRM

E-mail to T. Smith/K. Garder re: Brogan noise (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Brogan noise (.1); Review and analysis of authorities cited by grant employees in follow-up to complaints (.6); Telephone conferences (2) with T. Smith re: Brogan noise (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from G. Wells re: Brogan noise (.1); E-mail to G. Wells re: Brogan noise (.1); Review, revise monthly Litigation Report (.2); E-mail to T. Smith, D. Wildes re: Brogan noise (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from K. Gardner re: Brogan noise (.1); E-mail to J. Dodson re: resolution of Autumn Blackeney v. Flagler/TCC (.1); Telephone conferences (2) with E. Steinmeyer re: Windstorm mitigation RFP (.2); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: windstorm mitigation RFP (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Wildes re: Brogan noise meeting (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Dodson re: resolution of Autumn Blackeney v. Flagler/TCC case (.1);

08/30/2011 WRM

Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Standish re: M.N. v. TCC case (.1); E-mails (4) to D. Standish re: M.N. v. TCC case resolution (.4); Preparation for second Brogan noise meeting with condo representatives (.4); E-mail to T. Smith re: Brogan noise issue (.1): Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Brogan noise issue (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from G. Wells re: Brogan noise issue (.1); E-mail to G. Wells re: Brogan noise issue (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: vendor public record request (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Hinson re: vendor public record request (.1); Analysis - public record request (.2); E-mail to T. Smith re: Vendor public records request (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re:

2.20 hrs.

3.20 hrs.

Jerry Schilling			Invo	ice#	10085	Page	15
	\$13	3,333.33					
BILLING SUMM	MARY						
Lo	ongfellow, B. Joe	Associate	9.50	hrs			
M	abile, William R	Attorney	101.30	hrs			
Fe	ees		110.80	hrs	100	\$1	3,333.33
Di	sbursements						\$0.00
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL							3,333.33